
Bid #  18-3- Copier Paper 

RESULTS

BOARD APPROVED
Contract Paper, 

Uniontown, OH

Paper Mart Inc, 

East Hanover, 

NJ

ITEM #
SHTS/ 

CTN
OFFSET XEROGRAPHY PAPER QTY UNIT

UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

1 5,000

#20 lb, White, 8 1/2 x 11, Must Operate 

on High Speed Copiers, Laser Printers & 

Offset Press. 20 pallets. Deliver on July 

6, 2017.

880 ctn $21.35 $18,788.00 $20.94 $18,427.20

2 5,000

#20 lb, White, 8 1/2 x 11, Must Operate 

on High Speed Copiers, Laser Printers & 

Offset Press. 20 pallets. Deliver on 

November 17, 2017.

840 ctn $21.27 $17,866.80 $21.19 $17,799.60

3 5,000

#20 lb, White, 8 1/2 x 11, Must Operate 

on High Speed Copiers, Laser Printers & 

Offset Press. 20 pallets. Deliver on 

March 9,  2018.

840 ctn $21.47 $18,034.80 $21.19 $17,799.60

4 5,000 #20 lb, Blue Bond, 8 1/2 x 11 15 ctn $32.20 $483.00 $31.58 $473.70

5 5,000 #20 lb, Blue Bond, 8 1/2 x 14 7 ctn $60.00 $420.00 $47.75 $334.25

6 5,000 #20 lb, Canary Bond, 8 1/2 x 11 20 ctn $32.20 $644.00 $31.58 $631.60

7 2,500 #20 lb, Canary Bond, 11 x 17 5 ctn $44.60 $223.00 $37.50 $187.50

8 5,000 #20 lb, Gray Bond, 8 1/2 x 11 4 ctn no bid $31.58 $126.32

9 2,500 #20 lb, Gray Bond, 11 x 17 2 ctn no bid $37.50 $75.00

10 2,500 #20 lb, Green Bond, 11 x 17 2 ctn $44.60 $89.20 $37.50 $75.00

11 2,500 #20 lb, Ivory Bond, 11 x 17 1 ctn $44.60 $44.60 $37.50 $37.50

12 5,000 #20 lb, Light Pink Bond, 8 1/2 x 11 10 ctn $32.20 $322.00 $31.58 $315.80

13 2,500 #20 lb, White Bond, 11 x 17 25 ctn $28.00 $700.00 $26.45 $661.25

14 750

#65 lb, Ultrawhite, Superfine, Cover 

Smooth Finish, 23 x 35, Stock MUST be 

cartonized

3 ctn no bid $214.87 $644.61

15 1,200
#70 Text, Pure White, Smooth Finish, 

23x35
12 ctn no bid $97.76 $1,173.12
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Bid #  18-3- Copier Paper 

RESULTS

ITEM #

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

Paterson Card 

and 

Paper,Paterso

n NJ

Sharda Paper, 

Brooklyn NY

Veritiv, Clifton 

NJ

WB Mason, 

Secaucus, NJ

UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

$22.50 $19,800.00 $22.50 $19,800.00 $22.25 $19,580.00 $20.48 $18,022.40

$23.00 $19,320.00 $22.50 $18,900.00 $22.75 $19,110.00 $20.48 $17,203.20

$23.50 $19,740.00 $22.50 $18,900.00 $23.25 $19,530.00 $20.48 $17,203.20

$39.00 $585.00 $33.50 $502.50 $35.24 $528.60 $30.60 $459.00

$57.50 $402.50 $48.00 $336.00 $47.58 $333.06 $38.90 $272.30

$39.00 $780.00 $33.50 $670.00 $35.24 $704.80 $30.60 $612.00

$42.50 $212.50 $42.50 $212.50 $37.40 $187.00 $41.30 $206.50

$39.00 $156.00 $33.50 $134.00 $35.24 $140.96 $30.60 $122.40

$42.50 $85.00 $42.50 $85.00 $37.40 $74.80 $44.30 $88.60

$42.50 $85.00 $42.50 $85.00 $37.40 $74.80 $41.30 $82.60

$42.50 $42.50 $42.50 $42.50 $37.40 $37.40 $41.30 $41.30

$39.00 $390.00 $33.50 $335.00 $35.24 $352.40 $30.60 $306.00

$27.43 $685.75 $28.00 $700.00 $26.80 $670.00 $24.18 $604.50

$354.26 $1,062.78 $390.00 $1,170.00 $319.00 $957.00 no bid

$73.90 $886.80 $305.00 $3,660.00 $222.25 $2,667.00 no bid
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Bid #  18-3- Copier Paper 

RESULTS

ITEM #

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

LOWEST 

BID TOTAL COST

$20.48 $18,022.40

$20.48 $17,203.20

$20.48 $17,203.20

$30.60 $459.00

$38.90 $272.30

$30.60 $612.00

$37.40 $187.00

$30.60 $122.40

$37.40 $74.80

$37.40 $74.80

$37.40 $37.40

$30.60 $306.00

$24.18 $604.50

$214.87 $644.61

$73.90 $886.80
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Bid #  18-3- Copier Paper 

RESULTS

BOARD APPROVED
Contract Paper, 

Uniontown, OH

Paper Mart Inc, 

East Hanover, 

NJ

ITEM #
SHTS/ 

CTN
OFFSET XEROGRAPHY PAPER QTY UNIT

UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

16 500
80# Text, Pure White, Smooth Finish, 23 

x 35
7 ctn no bid $50.33 $352.31

17 2,000 #67 lb, Blue, Bristol, 8 1/2 x 11 7 ctn $34.94 $244.58 $29.82 $208.74

18 1,000 #67 lb, Blue, Bristol, 11 x 17 3 ctn $36.94 $110.82 $32.34 $97.02

19 2,000 #67 lb, Canary Bristol, 8 1/2 x 11 2 ctn $34.94 $69.88 $29.82 $59.64

20 2,000 #67 lb, Gray, Vellum Bristol, 8 1/2 x 11 2 ctn $34.94 $69.88 $29.82 $59.64

21 1,000 #67 lb, Gray, Vellum Bristol, 11 x 17 1 ctn $36.94 $36.94 $32.34 $32.34

22 2,000 #67 lb, Green, Bristol, 8 1/2 x 11 2 ctn $34.94 $69.88 $29.82 $59.64

23 2,000 #67 lb, Goldenrod, Bristol, 8 1/2 x 11 2 ctn $34.94 $69.88 $29.82 $59.64

24 2,000 #67 lb, Ivory, Bristol, 8 1/2 x 11 3 ctn $34.94 $104.82 $29.82 $89.46

25 1000 #67 lb, Ivory, Bristol, 11 x 17 2 ctn $36.94 $73.88 $32.34 $64.68

26 2,000 #67 lb, White, Vellum Bristol, 8 1/2 x 11 20 ctn $33.35 $667.00 $27.60 $552.00

27 1,000 #67 lb, White, Vellum Bristol, 11 x 17 20 ctn $35.34 $706.80 $29.35 $587.00
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Bid #  18-3- Copier Paper 

RESULTS

ITEM #

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

Paterson Card 

and 

Paper,Paterso

n NJ

Sharda Paper, 

Brooklyn NY

Veritiv, Clifton 

NJ

WB Mason, 

Secaucus, NJ

UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

$35.20 $246.40 $317.00 $2,219.00 $232.90 $1,630.30 no bid

$33.95 $237.65 $33.50 $234.50 $29.95 $209.65 $29.84 $208.88

$35.95 $107.85 $33.50 $100.50 $31.70 $95.10 $36.84 $110.52

$33.95 $67.90 $33.50 $67.00 $29.95 $59.90 $29.84 $59.68

$33.95 $67.90 $33.50 $67.00 $29.95 $59.90 $29.84 $59.68

$35.95 $35.95 $33.50 $33.50 $31.70 $31.70 $36.84 $36.84

$33.95 $67.90 $33.50 $67.00 $29.95 $59.90 $29.84 $59.68

$33.95 $67.90 $33.50 $67.00 $29.95 $59.90 $29.84 $59.68

$33.95 $101.85 $33.50 $100.50 $29.95 $89.85 $29.84 $89.52

$35.95 $71.90 $33.50 $67.00 $31.70 $63.40 $36.84 $73.68

$30.50 $610.00 $32.50 $650.00 $28.20 $564.00 $28.32 $566.40

$31.50 $630.00 $32.50 $650.00 $29.95 $599.00 $30.44 $608.80
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Bid #  18-3- Copier Paper 

RESULTS

ITEM #

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

LOWEST 

BID TOTAL COST

$35.20 $246.40

$29.82 $208.74

$31.70 $95.10

$29.82 $59.64

$29.82 $59.64

$31.70 $31.70

$29.82 $59.64

$29.82 $59.64

$29.82 $89.46

$31.70 $63.40

$27.60 $552.00

$29.35 $587.00
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